1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

- 2. I am an attorney responsible for the billings in this case. I can authenticate the following information as true and correct. The time and amount billed has been reviewed and edited and the fees and costs charged are reasonable.
- 3. In its February 3, 2016 Order Holding Defendant in Contempt of Court, the Court stated that "Plaintiff is duly awarded his attorney fees incurred as a result of the contempt." The following is a list of the fees and costs specifically relating to Plaintiff's Motion for Judgment Debtor Examination. A true and correct copy of a redacted client ledger for the following entries is attached hereto as Exhibit 1. NOTE: Exhibit 1 contains two (2) redacted client ledgers, one from Watson Rounds which reflects services through 8-4-2015; and, another from Brownstein Hyatt Farber Schreck, LLP, which reflects services from 9-1-2015 through the present.
- 4. Between June 4-5, 2015, Matthew Francis, a partner at Watson Rounds (presently Brownstein Hyatt Farber Schreck, LLP) I spent a total of 7.4 hours drafting the Motion for Judgment Debtor Examination. Our hourly rate for this matter is \$300 per-hour. The task necessarily required review of legal authorities, chronicling the discovery dispute for the Court, researching, and compiling exhibits for the Motion. See Exhibit 1.
- 5. On June 10-11, 2015, my assistant Nancy Lindsley reviewed the draft Motion for Judgment Debtor Examination and supporting documents, including a proposed Order. Ms. Lindsley transmitted the document for filing and scanned the file-stamped document and transmitted it for review by Plaintiff. Ms. Lindsley spent 1.2 hours on this project. Her hourly rate as a paralegal for this matter is \$125 per-hour. See Exhibit 1.
- 6. On June 29, 2015, I spoke to counsel for Defendant Reza Zandian regarding the Motion for Judgment Debtor Examination; and, between July 1-6, 2015 I reviewed Defendant Zandian's Opposition to Motion for Debtor's Examination and Motion for Protective Order, I communicated with Plaintiff Jed Margolin regarding my call with Mr. Zandian's counsel and the Opposition to Motion for Debtor's Examination and Motion for Protective Order which was filed on behalf of Mr. Zandian. I also reviewed Mr. Margolin's detailed response to the opposition. I spent a total of 4.8 hours for such services.

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

- Between July 8-21, 2015, I prepared Plaintiff's Reply in support of his Motion for 7. Judgment Debtor's Examination. A total of 14.7 hours of legal services were expended in preparation of such reply.
- 8. On July 20, 2015, Defendant Zandian filed a Reply in support of his Motion for Protective Order. Between July 20, 2015 through August 4, 2015, 3.6 hours of legal services were expended in connection with pursuing Plaintiff's Motion for Judgment Debtor Examination and to Produce Documents, including a Request for Hearing on Plaintiff's motion.
- 9. On September 22, 2015, the Court entered its Order to Set Hearing in this matter. Between September 24, 2015 through November 9, 2015, 12.60 hours of legal services were expended in setting a hearing on Plaintiff's Motion for Judgment Debtor Examination and to Produce Documents, preparing for and attending the hearing in this matter on November 5, 2015 and preparing the Order on Motion for Judgment Debtor Examination and to Produce Documents.
- 10. Following the hearing in this matter on November 5, 2015 and entry of the Court's Order Granting Plaintiff's Motion for Debtor Examination and to Produce Documents on November 6, 2015, 24.0 hours of legal services have been expended in preparing a Motion for Order to Show Cause Re Contempt and attending an Order to Show Cause hearing on February 3, 2016, which resulted in the Court's Order Holding Defendant in Contempt and issuing a Warrant of Arrest for Defendant Reza Zandian.
- As delineated above and in Exhibit 1, a total of 58.61 hours have been expended 11. by Matthew Francis and me, which equates to a grand total of \$17,584.03. Ms. Lindsley spent a total of 20.72 hours of billable work on this project, which equates to a otal of \$2,590.00. The grand total of fees requested are therefore \$20,174.03. See Exhibit 1.
- The costs involved with this project equated to \$241.28. The costs requested are 12. therefore \$241.28. See Exhibit 1.

27

///

///

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct to the best of my knowledge.

AFFIRMATION PURSUANT TO NRS 239B.030

The undersigned does hereby affirm that the preceding document does not contain the social security number of any person.

DATED: February 19, 2016.

BROWNSTEIN HYATT FARBER SCHRECK, LLP

Ву:__

Matthew D. Francis Adam P. McMillen 5371 Kietzke Lane Reno, NV 89511

Telephone: (775) 324-4100 Facsimile: (775) 333-8171 Attorneys for Plaintiff

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE Pursuant to NRCP 5(b), I certify that I am an employee of Brownstein Hyatt Farber Schreck, LLP, and that on this date, I deposited for mailing, in a sealed envelope, with first-class postage prepaid, a true and correct copy of the foregoing document, DECLARATION OF ADAM P. MCMILLEN, addressed as follows: Reza Zandian c/o Alborz Zandian 9 MacArthur Place, Unit 2105 Santa Ana, CA 92707-6753 Severin Carlson, Esq. Tara Zimmerman, Esq. BROWNSTEIN HYATT FARBER SCHRECK, LLP 5371 Kietke Lane Reno, Nevada 89511 775-324-4100 510 West Fourth Street Carson City, NV 89703 (courtesy copy only) Nancy R. Lindsley Dated: February /9, 2016. 055457\0001\14459314.1

Exhibit 1

Exhibit 1

Feb/ 9/2016 ...

Date Paid To
Entry # Explanation

Chq# Rec# Watson Rounds
Client Ledger
From May/ 1/2015
---- General -----|
Ropts Disbs

Bld |------ Trust Activity ------| Fees Inv# Acc Ropts Disbs Balance

Page: 1

5457 Margolin, Jed
A*5457.01 Patent theft analysis & litigation
REDACTED

Archived: 12/15/2015 Close No: MC0000010090 Resp Lawyer: APM

Jun 4/2015	Lawyer: APM 2.30 Hrs X 300.00	
1179116	Draft motion to compel debtor's	690,00 132467
	examination	690.00 13246/ Electrical Control of Control
Jun 4/2015	Lawyer: APM 0.30 Hrs X 300.00	
1179117	Review and respond to email,	90.00 132467
	dated 6/4/15, from Jed	
	Margolin regarding proceeding	
	with execution on judgment	
Jun 4/2015	Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00	
1179118	Draft email to Sev Carlson	30.00 132467
	requesting address for Zandian	
	to have debtor's examination	
Jun 4/2015	Lawyer: APM 0.70 Hrs X 300.00	
1179120	Research legal basis for taking	210.00 132467
	video-conference deposition of	
	Zandian in Paris, France	

Watson Rounds
Client Ledger
From May/ 1/2015
----- General -----|
Ropts Disbs

Chq#

Rec#

Bld |------|
Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs Balance Inv# Acc Rcpts

Page: 2

Date Received From/Paid To Explanation

Jun 4/2015 Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00
1179127 Review and respond to email,
dated 6/4/15, from Jed
Margolin regarding motion for
debtor's examination

30.00 132467

Fees

REDACTED

1179262

Jun 5/2015 Lawyer: APM 1.90 Hrs X 300.00 Finish drafting motion for debtor's examination

REDACTED

570.00 132467

600.00 132467

Jun _5/2015 Lawyer: MDF 2.00 Hrs X 300.00 1180028 Review and revise motion for debtor's examination

APM re: same/Research

"residence" for debtor's examination issue/Review order for debtor's examination

Watson Rounds Client Ledger From May/ 1/2015

Disbs

Repts

Chq# Rec#

Bld |-----| Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs Balance Fees Rcpts Balance

Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation REDACTED

Jun 10/2015 Lawyer; NRL 0.50 Hrs X 125.00
1180325 Finalize Motion for Debtor's
Examination and proposed Order
for filing; transmit via RCMS
to First Judicial District
Court; serve opposing counsel
via U.S. Mail; calendar
response to motion

62.50 132467

REDACTED

Jun 11/2015 Lawyer: NRL 0.70 Hrs X 125.00
Telephone conference with Ace
Attorney Service regarding
service of SDT's in
California; scan filed Motion
for Judgment Debtor
Examination and to Produce Documents; preparation of email to client transmitting documents

87.50 132467

Received From/Paid To Explanation

Watson Rounds
Client Ledger
From May/ 1/2015
---- General ----|
Rcpts Disbs

Chq#

Rec#

Bld |-----| Inv# Acc Repts Disbs Balance

Page: 4

Date '
Entry # REDACTED

Oun 29/2015 Lawyer: AFM 0.50 Hrs x 300.00

1181444 Telephone call with Tara
Zimmerman, new attorney for
Zandian, regarding her
objection to third-party
subpoenas, opposition to
motion for debtor's
examination and question
whether or not Margolin is
interested in settlement

150.00 132467

Fees

Jun 30/2015 1181613

REDACTED

Lawyer: NRL 0.70 Hrs X 125.00 Download Opposition to Motion for Debtor Judgment Examination; calendar deadline for response; review and

87.50 132467

Watson Rounds Client Ledger From May/ 1/2015

Page: 5

Date Entry #

Received From/Paid To

Chq#

Ropts

Fees Inv# Acc

Bld |------| Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs Balance Rcpts

REDACTED

Jul 1/2015 Lawyer: APM 1.80 Hrs X 300.00
1181856 Review Zandian's opposition to
motion for debtor's
examination, dated 6/29/15

540.00 132960

REDACTED

Jul 1/2015 1181861

Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00 Draft email to Jed Margolin regarding Zandian's opposition to motion for debtor's exam and Tara Zimmerman's conflict of

Jul 1/2015 1181868

Tara Zimmerman's conflict of interest issue
Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00
Review and respond to email,
dated 7/1/15, from Jed
Margolin regarding Zandian's
opposition to motion for
debtor's examination, etc

30.00 132960

30.00 132960

Feb/ 9/2016 Page: 6

Watson Rounds Client Ledger From May/ 1/2015 Received From/Paid To Chq# Explanation

Bld |----- Trust Activity ------Ropts Fees Inv# Acc Disbs Balance

REDACTED

Date

Lawyer: APM 0.30 Hrs X 300,00 Review and respond to email, dated 7/3/15, from Jed Margolin regarding Zandian's opposition to motion for debtor's examination Jul 3/2015 1182235

90.00 132960

REDACTED

Lawyer: APM 0.30 Hrs X 300.00 Finish review of email, dated 7/3/15, from Jed Margolin regarding Zandian's opposition to motion for debtor's Jul 6/2015 1182236

combiton 1.40 Hrs X 300.00 Review Jed Margolin's detailed response to opposition to motion for debtor's Jul 6/2015 1182237 examination and associated documents

90.00 132960

420.00 132960

REDACTED

Lawyer: APM 1.30 Hrs X 300.00 Draft reply in support of motion for debtor's examination Jul 8/2015 1183040

390.00 132960

REDACTED

9/2015 Lawyer: APM 7.60 Hrs X 300.00
1183111 Continue drafting reply in support of motion for debtor's examination and other discovery 10/2015 Lawyer: APM 1.90 Hrs X 300.00
1183209 Finish drafting reply in Jul 9/2015 1183111 Jul 10/2015

2280.00 132960

570.00 132960

Feb/ 9/2016 .

Watson Rounds Client Ledger

Page: 7

				May/ 1/2015						
Date '	Received From/Paid To	Chq#		eral					Activity	
Entry #	Explanation	Rec#	Repts	Disbs	Fees	Inv#	Acc	Ropts	Disbs	Balance
Jul 10/2015 1183210 Jul 10/2015	support of motion for debtor's examination and discovery Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00 Review and respond to email, dated 7/10/15, from Jed Margolin regarding reply in support of motion for debtor's examination and discovery Lawyer: NRL 2.10 Hrs X 125.00				30,00	132960				
1183249	Review/proof Reply iso Motion tor Debor Examination; preparation of list of exhibits; compile exhibits; telephone conference with Reno Carson Messenger Service regarding filing today; duplicate Reply and Exhibits; scan; serve via first class mail				262.50	132960				
Jul 10/2015 1183343	Lawyer: MDF 1.00 Hrs X 300.00 Review and revise Reply in Support of Motion for Debtor Examination/Conferences with				300.00	132960				
EDACTED	Adam re: same									
Jul 10/2015	Expense Recovery		(
1184997	Photocopies 504 @ 0.25 - Reply/exhibits	17521	V	126.00		132960				
Jul 10/2015 1185005	Expense Recovery Photocopies 168 @ 0.25 - Reply/exhibits	17521		42.00		132960				
Jul 13/2015 1183436	Lawyer: NRL 0.30 Hrs X 125.00 Calendar reply re Motion for Protective Order and calendar submission of Motion for Debtor's Examination; download file stamped copy of Reply iso Motion for Judgmente Debtor Exmination				37.50	132960				
DACTED	PARTHAL TON									

REDACTED

120.00 132960

Page: 8

Watson Rounds
Client Ledger
From May/ 1/2015
----- General -----|
Rcpts Disbs Date Received From/Paid To Entry # Explanation Chq# Rec# Bld ------ Trust Activity ------|
Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs Balance Fees

REDACTED

Jul 21/2015 Lawyer: NRL 0.50 Hrs X 125.00
1184221 Email to Jed transmitting Reply
iso Motion for Judgment Debtor
Examination; telephone

	Lawyer: APM 1.00 Hrs X 300.00 Review Zandian's reply in	300.00	132960
	support of motion for		
	protective order, dated 7/20/15		
Jul 21/2015	Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00		
1184201	Review utility bill for Zandian	30.00	132960
	for his French address, dated		
Jul 21/2015	6/25/15		
	Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00 Review French Tax bill, dated	20.00	132960
1184202	10/15/14, for Zandian	30,00	132960
Jul 21/2015	Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00		
1184203	Review 7/4/15 Centre Des	30.00	132960
110100	Finances Publicques statement	30100	154500
	for Zandian		
Jul 21/2015	Lawyer: APM 0.20 Hrs X 300.00		
1184204	Review Iranian passport for	60.00	132960
	Zandian		
Jul 21/2015	Lawyer: APM 0.30 Hrs X 300.00		,
1184205	Review French Autorisation	90.00	132960
	Provisoire De Sejour for		
THE RESERVE AND ADDRESS OF THE PARTY OF THE	Zandian	ST 500000 The second	
Jul 21/2015	Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00		
1184206	Draft email to Jed Margolin	30.00	132960
	regarding Zandian's reply in		
	support of motion for		
Jul 21/2015	protective order Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00		
1184207	Draft email to Matt Francis	30.00	122060
1104207	regarding Zandian's reply in	30.00	132300
	support of motion for		
	protective order		
REDACTED			

62.50 132960

Feb/ 9/2016 Page: 9

Date Entry #

Received From/Paid To Explanation

Watson Rounds
Client Ledger
From May/ 1/2015
---- General ----|
Ropts Disbs Chq# Rec#

Bld |-----|
Inv# Acc Rcpts Disbs Balance

Jul 21/2015 1184222	Lawyer: NRL 0.50 Hrs X 125.00 Review Defendant's Reply iso Motion for Protective Order; scan and save	62.50 132960
Jul 21/2015 1184250		300.00 132960
* 2 * 5		
	1	
Jul 22/2015	Lawyer: NRL 0.70 Hrs X 125.00	
1184263	Review local rules re hearing	87.50 132960
	on motions; preparation of	The state of the s
	draft Request for Hearing on Plaintiff's Motion for	
	Judgment Debtor Examination	
	and to Produce Records	
Jul 22/2015	Lawyer: NRL 0.20 Hrs X 125.00	是1990年1月1日在1980年,1990年8月1日,1990年1日,1990年1月1日,1990年1日,1990年1日,1990年1日,1990年1日,1990年1日,1990年1日,1990年1日,1990年1日,
1184267	Finalize Request for Hearing;	25.00 132960
	transmit for filing and service	
Jul 22/2015 1184273	Lawyer: APM 0.30 Hrs X 300.00 Draft/revise request for oral	90.00 132960
11842/3	argument on motion for	90.00 132960
	debtor's examination	
Jul 22/2015	Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00	
1184278	Review email, dated 7/22/15,	30.00 132960
	from Jed Margolin regarding	
	Zandian's reply in support of his motion for protective order	
Jul 22/2015	Lawyer: APM 0.20 Hrs X 300.00	면도 한당 기계에 인터넷 본 발표를 받고 한 기계에 발표하면, 이렇게 되었다고 있는데 항상 발표를 한다면 하는데 한다면 한다면 하는데 하는데 한다는데 된다는데 모양을 하는데 한다고 있다. 한다는데
1184279	Review Jed Margolin's comments	60.00 132960
	document related to Zandian's	
	reply iso motion for	
************	protective order	
Jul 22/2015 1184280	Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00 Draft email to Jed Margolin	30.00 132960
1184280	regarding Zandian's reply iso	30.00 132700
	of motion for protective order	
PEDACTED		

REDACTED

Aug 4/2015 Lawyer: APM 0.10 Hrs X 300.00
1185357 Review file stamped request for
hearing on motion for debtor's
examination. dated 7/23/15

REDACTED

30.00 136014

Watson Rounds
Client Ledger
From May/ 1/2015
----- General -----|
Ropts Disbs

Page: 10

Date Received From/Paid To
Entry # Explanation

Chq# Rec#

Bld |------|
Inv# Acc Ropts Disbs Balance

2/9/2016 1:11

TIMECARD LISTING

Client: 055457 Jed Margolin

Work Timek Timekeep Curre Work Work WIP WIP WIP Bil Matter Matter Name Narrative Std Standard Std Ref Referenc Ref
Date eeper er Name ncy Hours Rate Amoun Hours Rate Amoun led Number Rate Amount Curren

Work Timek Timekeep Curre Work Work Work WIP WIP Bil Matter Matter Name Narrative Std Standard Std Ref Referenc Ref Date eeper er Name ncy Hours Rate Amoun Hours Rate Amoun led Number Rate Amount Curren

REDACTED

9/24/2 2085 015	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.50	125.0	62.50	0.50	125.0	62.50 🔽	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review Court's Order to Set Hearing; scan and save; email to client; calendar setting and reminder to contact court to provide contact information	175.0 0	87.50 USD	175.0 0	87.50 USD
10/7/2 2085 015	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.30	125.0	37.50	0.30	125.0	37.50 🗷	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Telephone conference with Judge Russell's administrative assistant to confirm setting of hearing on Motion for Judgment Debtor Examination and to Produce Documents	175.0 0	52.50 USD	125.0	37.50 USD
10/9/2 2085 015	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.30	125.0 0	37.50	0.30	125.0	37.50 🔽	055457.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review Hearing Date Memo; confirm calendared; transmit to client via email	175.0 0	52.50 USD	125.0 0	37.50 USD

	Timekeep er Name					Matter Name	Narrative			Referenc Ref e Amount Currer
							docket sheet, as filed 10/9/15	al management of the second		

10/20/ 2092 2015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.70	300.0	210.00	0.70	300.0	210.00	V	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Telephone conference with J. Margolin re debtor's examination and issues related to executing on the judgment	335.0 0	234.50 USD	300.0	210.00 USD
11/4/2 2085 015	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	1.70	125.0 0	212.50	1.70	125.0 0		>	055457.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Prepare for hearing on Motion for Judgment Debtor Examination; compile all pleadings and exhibits; create binder for hearing	175.0	297.50 USD	125.0	212.50 USD
11/4/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	1.30	300.0	390.00	1.30	300.0	390.00	V	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review motion for debtor's examination in preparation for tomorrow's	335.0 0	435.50 USD	300.0	390.00 USD

	<u> </u>	1.			1.4	M. Market				distriction of the second		hearing on same		And the second second	(1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1) (1)	
11/5/2 2091 015	Matthew D. Francis	USD	0.30	300.0 0	90.00	0.30	300.0	90.00	☑ 05545 1	7.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Emails with A. McMillen re hearing on Motion for Debtor's Examination	380.0 0	114.00 USD	380.0 0	114.00 USD
11/5/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.50	300.0 0	150.00	0.50	300.0	150.00	☑ 05545 1	7.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Travel to Courthouse for hearing on motion for debtor's examination	335.0 0	167.50 USD	300.0 0	150.00 USD
11/5/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	1.00	300.0	300.00	1.00	300.0	300.00	✓ 05545 1	57.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Finish reviewing motion for debtor's examination of Zandian and plan and prepare for argument before Judge Russel today	335.0 0	335.00 USD	300.0	300,00 USD
11/5/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	1.20	300.0	360.00	1.20	300.0	360.00	☑ 05545 1	57.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Attend hearing on motion for debtor's examination with Judge Russell	335.0 0	402.00 USD	300.0 0	360.00 USD
11/5/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.50	300.0 0	150.00	0.50	.300.0 0	150.00	☑ 05545 1	57.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Travel from Courthouse to office after hearing on motion for debtor's examination	335.0 0	167.50 USD	300.0	150.00 USD
11/5/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0 0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00	☑ 05545 1	57.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to J. Margolin re outcome of hearing on motion for debtor's examination	335.0 0	33.50 USD	300.0 0	30.00 USD
11/6/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0 0	60.00	0.20	300.0 0	60.00	✓ 05545 1	57.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to S. Carlson re proposed judgment re debtor's examination	335.0 0	67.00 USD	300.0 0	60.00 USD
11/6/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.30	300.0 0	90.00	0.30	300.0 0	90.00	☑ 0554: 1	57.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Revise proposed order re debtor's examination for Zandian	335.0 0	100.50 USD	300.0 0	90.00 USD
11/6/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0	60.00	0.20	300.0	60.00	✓ 05541 1	57.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Plan and prepare for telephone conference with J. Margolin re plan for moving forward after order received from court re debtor's examination	335.0 0	67.00 USD	300.0	60.00 USD
11/6/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.80	300.0	240.00	0.80	300.0 0	240.00	☑ 05548 1	57.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Telephone conference with J. Margolin re debtor's examination order from the court and going forward	335.0 0	268.00 USD	300.0	240.00 USD

Page 4

Narrative

Std Standard Std Ref Referenc Ref Rate Amount Curren Rate e Amount Curren

Matter Name

2/9/2016 1:11

Work Timek Timekeep Curre Work Work WiP WIP Bil Matter Date eeper er Name ncy Hours Rate Amoun Hours Rate Amoun led Number

Work Timek Date eeper						WIP lours	WIP Rate	WIP Bil Amoun led	Matter Number	Matter Name	Narrative	PART TO SERVICE STATE OF THE SERVICE STATE	Standard Std Amount Gurren	A STATE OF THE PARTY OF THE PAR	Referenc Ref e Amount Curren
11/6/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0 0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹 (1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 11/6/15, from S. Carlson re proposed order on motion for debtor's examination	335.0 0	33.50 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
11/6/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	1.30	300.0 0	390.00	1.30	300.0 0	390.00 🗹 (055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft proposed order on motion for debtor's examination	335.0 0	435.50 USD	300.0 0	390.00 USD
11/6/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0 0	30.00 🗹 (055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 11/6/15, from S. Carlson to A. Jeffries (judge's assistant) re proposed order re debtor's examination	335.0	33.50 USD	300.0 0	30.00 USD
11/6/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0 0	30.00	0.10	300.0		055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review another email, dated 11/6/15, from S. Carlson re the proposed order re debtor's examination	335.0 0	33.50 USD	300.0 0	30.00 USD
11/9/2 2085 015	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	1.10	125.0 0		1.10	125.0 0	137.50 🔽	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review Order Granting Plaintiff's Motion for Debtor Examination and to Produce Documents; calendar deadline; prepare Notice of Entry of Order	175.0 0	192.50 USD	125.0 0	137.50 USD
11/9/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0 0	60.00	0.20	300.0 0	60.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to S. Carlson re settlement and setting up debtor's examination/ deposition of Zandian	335.0 0	67.00 USD	300.0 0	60.00 USD
11/9/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0 0	Of Carlot and Carlot and Carlot	0.10	300.0 0	LOS CONTRACTOR CONTRAC	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 11/9/15, from S. Carlson re discovery and settlement issues	335.0 0	33.50 USD	300.0 0	30.00 USD
11/10/ 2085 2015	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.60	125.0 0	75.00	0.60	125.0 0	75.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Prepare Notice of Entry of Order	175.0 0	105.00 USD	125.0 0	75.00 USD
11/12/ 2085 2015	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.40	125.0 0		0.40	125.0 0	_	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Telephone conference with Court staff regarding obtaining CD of 11/5/2015 hearing; review on-line	175.0 0		125.0 0	50.00 USD

J	
$_{\mid}$ \leq	
Ŧ	
_ 	
263	
37	

Work Timek Date eeper		Curre	Work Hours	Work Rate	Work Amoun	WIP Hours	WIP Rate	WIP Bi Amoun led		Matter Name	Narrative	Std Rate	Standard Amount	Std Curren	Ref Rate	Referenc Ref e Amount Curren
		da Greek Tiller									forms for Public CD Rom Order Form; complete same for transmittal to Court					and anything and
11/13/ 2085 2015	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.20	125.0 0		0.20	125.0 0	25.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review filed Notice of Entry of Order; save to file	175.0 0		USD	125.0	
11/17/ 2092 2015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	FA PLANTAGE CONTRACTOR	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹] 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to S. Carlson re debtor's examination	335.0 0	25 C C C C C C C C C C C C C C C C C C C	USD	300.0	
11/17/ 2092 2015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0		0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹] 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to J. Margolin re settlement offer and debtor's examination	335.0 0		USD	300.0	
11/17/ 2092 2015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0		0.10	300.0	30.00 🗸	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 11/17/15, from S. Carlson re offer to settle this matter and him getting dates for the debtor's examination	335.0 0		USD	300.0	PERSONAL DICELO COLLO COLLO DE SERVICIO DE LA CALLA DEL LA CALLA DE LA CALLA DE LA CALLA DE LA CALLA DEL LA CALLA DE LA CALLA
11/18/ 2092 2015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0		0.20	300.0	60.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 11/17/15, from S. Carlson re offer to discuss options to settle this matter	335.0		USD	300.0	
11/18/ 2092 2015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0	STATISTICAL PROPERTY.	0.20	300.0		055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to S. Carlson re settlement issues	335.0 0		USD	300.0 (
11/30/ 2092 2015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0	60.00	0.20	300.0	60.00	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review issued remittitur, dated 11/30/15	335.0		USD	300.0	0 60.00 USD
12/3/2 2092 015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	NEXT SECURITION	0,10	300.0	30.00	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to S. Carlson requesting dates for debtor's examination	335.0 () USD	300.0	30.00 USD
12/7/2 2085 015	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.50	125.0		0.50	125.0 0	62.50	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Duplicate DVD of 11/5/15 hearing to portable drive; transmit to client	175.0		USD	175.0	0 87.50 USD 0

Work Timek Date eeper					Work Amoun	WIP Hours	WIP Rate	WIP Amour	Bil led	Matter Number	Matter Name	Narrative	Std Rate	Standard Amount	Std Curren		Referenc Ref e Amount Curre
12/14/ 2092 2015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0	60.00	0.20	300.0	60.00) <u>V</u>	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	motion Review notice of appeal, dated 12/10/15, re order granting plaintiff's motion for debtor examination and to produce documents	335.0 0		USD	335.0	67.00 USD
12/14/ 2092 2015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0		0.10	300.0 0) 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review Affidavit of S. Carlson in support of motion to withdraw	335.0 0		USD	335.0 0	33.50 USD
12/14/ 2092 2015	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00) \	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to J. Margolin re motion to withdraw and appeal of debtor's examination order	335.0 0		USD	335.0 0	33.50 USD
ACTED																	

	search re 335.0 167.50 USD 300.0 150.00 USD
2015 McMillen 0 0 1 analysis and whether or not the	e order 0 0
litigation re debtor's exam	ination is
appealable	

		Timekeep er Name								Bil Matter ed Numbe		Narrative	Std Rate	Standard Amount	NEW PROSTORUS CONTROL		Referenc e Amount	
REDACT	ED	5 CBN 1275-1-2921-70								11 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1					SA SPECIAL			
- 12/16/ 2015	BALL STREET, SECTION STREET,	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	NUMBER OF STREET	0.10	300.0	PROCESSION CONTRACTOR	☑ 055457.0 1	000 Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review Order granting motion for debtor's examination and to produce documents filed in supreme court on 12/16/15	335.0	ALEXANDER STATE OF THE STATE OF	USD	300.0	30.00	USD

Work Timek Timekeep Curre Work Work WIP WIP Bil Matter Matter Name Narrative Std Standard Std Ref Referenc Ref Date eeper er Name ncy Hours Rate Amount Hours Rate Amount Curren

Page 9

Work Timek Timekeep Cu Date eeper er Name no			ndard Std Ref nount Curren Rate	Service and the service of the servi
DACTED				

1/4/20 2092 Adam P. USD 0.10 300.0 30.00 0.10 300.0 30.00 USD 0.55457.000 Patent theft searches for Zandian's 0 0 0 1 analysis and litigation sasets in order to bypass court system re appeal of debtor examination order, if possible

REDACTED

1/7/20 2091 Matthew USD 1.00 300.0 300.00 1.00 300.0 300.00 ☑ 055457.000 Patent theft 380.0 Review challenge to 380.00 USD 380.0 380.00 USD 16 D. Francis 0 analysis and Zandian appeal in NV Supreme Court Order; emails with A. McMillen re 0 0 litigation contempt issues; review

		Timekeep er Name					WIP Hours	WIP Rate		Bil led	Matter Number	Matter Name	Narrative	Std Rate	Standard Amount	Std Curren	Ref Rate	Referenc Ref e Amount Curren
Contract of the Contract of th		S. C. S.								2000		2-	emails with client	ZOLD VALUE OF STREET			IN THE PARTY OF TH	
1/7/20 16		Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0 0	Control of the Contro	0.10	300.0 0		>	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to J. Margolin re Supreme Court's order to show cause, dated 1/7/16	350.0 0		USD	300.0	See Ford J. P. March Land B. Warner and House Service
1/7/20 16		Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0		0.10	300.0	30.00	V	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Discuss next steps with M. Francis re motion to contempt for Zandian not producing the documents	350.0	35.00	USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/7/20 16	Committee of the last of the l	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0	to 12 Darking Studies	0.20	300.0		S	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review order to show cause, 1/7/16	350.0	70.00	USD	300.0	SELECTION OF THE PROPERTY OF T

1/8/20 2092 16	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20 30	0.00	60.00	0.20 300.0	60.00 🗹 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to J. Margolin re future motion for order to show cause	350.0 0	70.00 USD	300.0	60.00 USD
-------------------	---------------------	-----	---------	------	-------	------------	-------------------------	--------------------------------------	---	------------	-----------	-------	-----------

Work Timek Timekeep Curre Work Work	Work WIP WIP Bil Matter	Matter Name Narrative Std	Standard Std Ref Referenc Ref
Date eeper er Name ncy Hours Rate	Amoun Hours Rate Amoun led Number	Rate	Amount Curren Rate e Amount Curren

1/11/2 2092 Adam P. USD 016 McMillen	0.10 300.0 30.00	0.10 300.0 30.00	1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to S. Carlson and T. Zimmerman re amended order to	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
					withdraw and request for Zandian's address and notice of impending				
					motion for order to show cause re documents for debtor's examination				

REDACTED

1/11/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹 055457 1	7.000 Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review another email, dated 1/11/16, from S. Carlson re confirmation of Zandian's California address	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/11/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹 055457 1	7.000 Patent theft analysis and litigation		350.0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD

JM_FJD_2643

Work Timek Date eeper						WIP lours	WIP Rate		Bil Matter ed Number	Matter Name	Narrative		andard Std Imount Curren		teferenc Ref Amount Curren
1/11/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0 0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 [☑ 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 1/11/16, from S. Carlson re his intention to file affidavit re Zandian's address	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/12/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00	☑ 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to J. Margolin re emergency motion for order to show cause for Zandian to produce documents	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/12/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	2.30	300.0	690.00	2.30	300.0	690.00	☑ 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft emergency motion for order to show cause why Zandian should not be held in contempt for not producing documents before 12/21/15	350.0 0	805.00 USD	300.0	690.00 USD
1/12/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0 0	30.00	0.10	300.0 0	30:00	☑ 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review filed district court docket entries, 1/11/16	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/12/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0	60.00	0.20	300.0	60.00	☑ 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, 1/11/16, from J. Margolin re emergency motion for order to show cause why Zandian should not be held in contempt	350.0 0	70.00 USD	300.0	60.00 USD
1/13/2 2085 016	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.70	125.0 0	87.50	0.70	125.0 0	87,50	☑ 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Prepare draft Request for Submission and proposed Order Shortening Time	175.0 0	122.50 USD	125.0 0	87.50 USD
1/13/2 2085 016	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.80	125.0 0	100.00	0.80	125.0 0	100.00	☑ 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review/proof/revise Motion for Order to Show Cause Re Contempt	175.0 0	140.00 USD	125.0 0	100.00 USD
1/13/2 2091 016	Matthew D. Francis	25 COUNTY OF THE PROPERTY OF	0.50	300.0 0	150.00	0.50	300.0 0	150.00	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review application for contempt and emails with A. McMillen re same	380.0	190.00 USD	380.0 0	190.00 USD
1/13/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.30	300.0	90.00	0.30	300.0 0	90.00	☑ 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Finish drafting motion for order to show cause to hold Zandian in contempt re documents for debtor's examination	350.0 0	105.00 USD	300.0 0	90.00 USD
1/13/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0 0	30.00	☑ 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and	Review email, dated 1/13/16, from J. Margolin	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0 0	30.00 USD

litigation re motion for order to show cause re documents for debtor's examination 1/13/2 2092 Adam P. USD 0.50 300.0 150.00 0.50 300.0 150.00 ☑ 055457.000 Patent theft on the first analysis and litination show cause re documents for debtor's examination 1/13/2 2092 Adam P. USD 0.50 300.0 150.00 0.50 300.0 150.00 ☑ 055457.000 Patent theft or motion for order to 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0		Timekeep er Name									Matter Number	Matter Name	Narrative	SHOW REPORTED	Standard Amount	THE TENSOR SHOW THE REST	KIND OF THE PARTY AND THE	Reference e Amount	
016 McMillen 0 0 1 analysis and remotion for order to 0 0								3 (19 3 (19) 3 (19) 4 (1) 4 (1)		71		litigation	show cause re documents						
			USD	0.50	300.0	150.00	0.50	300.0	150.00		055457.000 1			350.0	175.00	USD	300.0	150.00	USD

1/14/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review Zandian's French residency permit, attached to S. Carlson's affidavit, dated 1/13/16	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/14/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to S. Carlson re Zandian's French residency information and requesting better copies of same	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD

REDACTED

1/14/2 2092 Adam P. USD	0.20 300.0 60.00 0.20 300	.0 60.00 2 055457.000 Patent theft	Research Nevada's 350.0 70.00 USD 300.0 60.00 USD
016 McMillen	0	0 1 analysis and	contempt statutes re 0 0
		litigation	potential jailing of Zandian

REDACTED

Work Timek Date eeper	AS A SECURITY OF THE SECURITY OF THE SECURITY SHOULD BE SECURED TO SECURE SECURITY SHOULD BE SECURED TO SECURE SECURITY SHOULD SECURE SECURITY SECU						WIP Rate	WIP Bil Amoun led		Matter Name	Narrative	the section where the first the section	andard Std mount Curren		leferenc Ref Amount Curren
1/14/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0 0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 1/14/16, from S. Carlson re Zandian's French residency information	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/15/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0 0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review third photograph of Zandian's French residency permit as provided by S. Carlson	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0 0	30.00 USD
1/15/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0 0	60.00	0.20	300.0 0	60.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review Zandian's Autorisation Provisoire De Sejour	350.0 0	70.00 USD	300.0 0	60.00 USD
1/15/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0,10	300.0 0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to J. Margolin re Zandian's French residency permit information	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/15/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review second photograph of Zandian's French residency permit as provided by S. Carlson	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/15/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0 0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗵	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 1/14/16, from S. Hascall re Zandian's French residency information	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/21/2 2085 016	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	1.20	125.0 0	150.00	1.20	125.0 0	150.00 🗹	055457.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Prepare draft Notice of Taking Deposition; coordinate location with San Diego office; revise Notice per A. McMillen; contact Court Reporter to arrange for reporter for 2/24/2016 debtor examination of R. Zandian	175.0 0	210.00 USD	175.0 O	210.00 USD
1/21/2 2085 016	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.20	125.0 0	25.00	0.20	125.0 0	25.00 🔽	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email from Court regarding scheduling Order to Show Cause Hearing; calendar same for 2/3/2016 at 9:30 a.m.	175.0 0	35.00 USD	175.0 0	35.00 USD
1/21/2 2091 016	Matthew D. Francis	USD	0.20	300.0 0	60.00	0.20	300.0 0	60.00 🔽	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review emails from opposing counsel re order to show cause hearing	380.0 0	76.00 USD	380.0 0	76.00 USD
1/21/2 2092	Adam P.	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹	055457.000	Patent theft	Draft email to J. Margolin	350.0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD

		Timekeep er Name					WIP Hours	WIP Rate	WIP Bil Amoun led		Matter Name	Narrative	Std Rate	Standard Std Amount Curren	Ref Rate	Referenc Ref e Amount Curre
016		McMillen			0			0		1.	analysis and litigation	re 2/3/16 hearing on motion for order to show cause	0		.0	
1/21/2 20 016		Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review additional emails between S. Carlson and A. Jeffries re S. Carlson no longer representing Zandian	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	
1/21/2 20 016		Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, from S. Carlson to A. Jeffries re order to show cause hearing	350.0 0		300.0	
1/21/2 20 016		Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0 0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Revise notice of debtor's examination for R. Zandian	350.0 0		300.0	
1/21/2 20 016		Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🔽	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 1/21/16, from A. Jeffries setting hearing on motion for order to show cause on 2/3/16	350.0 0		300.0	
1/21/2 20 016)ACTED		Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.60	300.0	180.00	0.60	300.0	180.00 ☑	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft notice of debtor's examination for Zandian in February 2016	350.0 0		300.0	
1/21/2 20 016	092	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 ☑	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to A. Jeffries, Judicial Assistant to Hon. James Russell, re dates for order to show cause hearing	350.0 0		300.0	
1/21/2 20 016	092	Adam P, McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	Ulbarrana sules dell'error di	0.10	300.0 0	30.00 🗹] 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 1/21/16, from A. Jeffries, Judicial Assistant to Hon. James Russell, requesting dates for order to show cause hearing	350.0 0		300.0	ALTO HER MANUAL COLUMN CONTRACTORS
1/22/2 20 016	092	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0		0.10	300.0		055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to R. Zandian re show cause hearing	350.0		300.0	
1/22/2 20	092	Adam P.	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗷	055457.000	Patent theft	Draft email to J. Margolin	350.0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 US

Page 16

TimeCard

016	McMillen			0			0		1	analysis and litigation	re order to show cause and hearing re same	0 ·		0	
1/22/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Finish review of notice of debtor's examination of Zandian to be sent out today	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/22/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30,00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 1/21/16, from J. Margolin re Court's setting up show cause hearing for Zandian to produce documents	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/25/2 2085 016	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.50	125.0	62.50	0.50	125.0	62.50 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review Order to Show Cause issued by Court; calendar hearing date; scan and save to Worksite; email to A. McMillen	175.0 0	87.50 USD	175.0 0	87.50 USD
1/25/2 2091 016	Matthew D. Francis	USD	0.30	300.0	90.00	0.30	300.0	90.00 🗷	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review order to show cause	380.0 0	114.00 USD	380.0 0	114.00 USD
1/25/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to J. Margolin re order to show cause	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/25/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review Order to Show Cause, dated 1/22/16	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/25/2 2092 016	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0 0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00 🗹	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to R. Zandian re order to show cause	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
1/27/2 2085 016	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.50	125.0 0	62.50	0.50	125.0 0	62.50 🗹] 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Arrange for travel for A. McMillen for Debtor's Examination in San Diego, CA	175.0 0	87.50 USD	125.0 0	62.50 USD
1/27/2 2092 016 DACTED	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0	60.00	0.20	300.0	60.00 🗷] 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Perform research re Zandian's possible whereabouts	350.0 0	70.00 USD	300.0	60.00 USD

Matter Name

Narrative

Std Standard Std Ref Referenc Ref

Rate Amount Curren Rate e Amount Curren

Work Timek Timekeep Curre Work Work Work WIP WIP Bil Matter Date eeper er Name ncy Hours Rate Amoun Hours Rate Amoun led Number

Work Timek Date eeper						WIP Hours	WIP Rate	WIP Bil Amoun led	A STATE OF THE PARTY NAMED AND ADDRESS.	Matter Name	Narrative		Standard Std Amount Curren		Referenc Ref Amount Curren
- 2/2/20 2092 16	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.10	300.0	30.00	0.10	300.0	30.00	055457.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review email, dated 2/2/16, from J. Margolin re tomorrow's show cause hearing before Judge Russell	350.0 0	35.00 USD	300.0	30.00 USD
2/2/20 2092 16	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.30	300.0	90.00	0.30	300.0	90.00	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Draft email to J. Margolin re tomorrow's show cause hearing before Judge Russell	350.0 0	105.00 USD	300.0	90.00 USD
2/2/20 2092 16	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0	60.00	0.20	300.0	60.00	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review Appellant's response to order to show cause on appeal case number 69372, dated 2/2/16	350.0 0	70.00 USD	300.0	60.00 USD
2/3/20 2085 16	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	1.00	125.0 0	125.00	1.00	125.0 0	125.00	055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Conf with A.McMillen and M.Francis regarding OSC hearing; review file to obtain passport of Zandian with his date of birth; contact Julie at First Judicial District Court to advise of Zandian's date of birth	175.0 0	175.00 USD	175.0 0	175.00 USD
2/3/20 2091 16	Matthew D. Francis		0.70	300.0	210.00	0.70	300.0		055457.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review Appellant's Response to Order to Show Cause filed in NV Supreme Court; conference with APM re hearing, bench warrant for Zandian and strategy moving forward	380.0	266.00 USD	380.0	266.00 USD
REDACTED	inkalaine maa kankiin maan ja ja tii kirid ka ma'aan ajii kaa	a) i Marilliani ann ait aiseach (is i	an a militadirid ng (integrible).	not interference de la comencia	nakadan Cara Caran	Tarin da azar Erania de Pala			and the second seco	очения выполняющий в продреждения в продостине		60 ECCTOT 18 10-484	PARTS (1715-1-16) 1944 (1715-1715) 1838 (1715-1815) 1715-1715	ACONTACONESSA SEN	
2/3/20 2092 16	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.20	300.0	60.00	0.20	300.0	60.00] 055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Review and respond to email, dated 2/3/16, from J. Margolin re today's	350.0 0		300.0	60.00 USD
2/9/2016 1:11									Pa	ige 18					TimeCard

Work Time Date eepe	k Timekeep r er Name					WIP Hours	WIP Rate	WIP Amoun	Bil led	Matter Number	Matter Name	Narrative	Std Rate	Standard Amount	Std Curren	Ref Rate	Referenc Ref e Amount Curren
												hearing on order to show cause and Zandian's bench warrant				DATE.	
2/3/20 2092 16	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.50	300.0	150.00	0.50	300.0	150.00		055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Meet with M. Francis re potential next steps in light of bench warrant for Zandian's arrest; draft email to Jed Margolin re today's hearing	350.0		USD	300.0	150.00 USD
2/3/20 2092 16	Adam P. McMillen	USD	1.70	300.0	510.00	1.70	300.0	510.00		055457.000	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Attend hearing on order to show cause re Zandian's failure to produce documents re his finances (includes travel time to and from office to Carson City courthouse)	350.0 0		USD	300.0	510.00 USD
2/5/20 2085 16	Nancy R. Lindsley	USD	0.50	125.0 0	62.50	0.50	125.0 0	62.50		055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	telephone conference with Julie at First Judicial District Court to confirm receipt of message re Zandian DOB; download filed Docket Entries; calendar reply to response to OSC	175.0		USD	175.0 0	87.50 USD
2/5/20 2092 16	Adam P. McMillen	USD	0.80	300.0	240.00	0.80	300.0			055457.000 1	Patent theft analysis and litigation	Telephone conference with J. Margolin re execution of judgment issues including arrest warrant of Zandian and debtor's examination	350.0	280.00	USD	300.0	240.00 USD

850			
		50	
		а.	а
8,5		dani	υ
	S.	10	-
е.	118		a
3.3	-1	51	2
Э.	т.	3.0	=3
1	щ	5.0	
×	7	9.5	=
	3	97	2
		100	6.5
	36	æ	38
	-1	7	3
	~	E-	n
ш	ш	7	4
		20	83
		82	-7
93		а.	-
	83	32	2
10	35	S.	₹
	-	щ	Э.
	-	SC.	-
	8	31	34
	Said.	8	2
ĸ.		ш	и
			58
	32		
		=	11
MIID	68	0	s
	-6	Ď.	-
6	33	4	u
	3	n	e.
	2	8	
3	縚		
		=1	n
100		₩.	ы
	Œ		=
	-	100	-
		30	•
L.	-	Ρ.	a
-	36	ы	ы
		30	a.
		37.	27
		В.	2
87	-2	31	-
	-2	E.	
3.	-3	100	
я.	9	₽.	-
MICH	4	S.	
10	-4	8.	3
	æ		т
2			ŝ
1	4	(U
1	4	(נע
1	2	,,,,	alc
711	2	0900	יסובי
VIII ON	2 0 2	0,00	Nate
NFC-IL	2 5 7	0,00	Laic
MEGAL	2 5 7	0,00	Late
MICHE MICH			nouls hate
71-0191	MACIN		
	MACIN		
71-0191	MACIN		
C. C. Land	G CUITE WOLK		
C. C. Land	G CUITE WOLK		
C. C. Land	G CUITE WOLK		
C. C. Land	G CUITE WOLK		
C. C. Land	G CUITE WOLK		
C. C. Land	G CUITE WOLK		
C. C. Land	MACIN		
C. C. Land	G CUITE WOLK		
C. C. Land	G CUITE WOLK		
C. C. Land	G CUITE WOLK		
C. C. Land	G CUITE WOLK		
C. C. Land	G CUITE WOLK		
The state of the s	IIIIIekeen ontre work		
The state of the s	IIIIIekeen ontre work	Momo none	
The state of the s	IIIIIekeen ontre work	Momo none	
The state of the s	IIIIIekeen ontre work	Momo none	
The state of the s	IIIIIekeen ontre work	Momo none	
The state of the s	IIIIIekeen ontre work	Momo none	
The state of the s	IIIIIekeen ontre work	Momo none	
The state of the s	G CUITE WOLK	Momo none	
The state of the s	IIIIIekeen ontre work	Momo none	
The state of the s	IIIIIekeen ontre work	Momo none	
The latest of th	C IIIII IIIII IIIII IIII IIII IIII III	Conor on Nome	ecuci el Mallie IIICY Mouis
The latest of th	C IIIII IIIII IIIII IIII IIII IIII III	Conor on Nome	ecuci el Mallie IIICY Mouis
The latest of th	C IIIII IIIII IIIII IIII IIII IIII III	Conor on Nome	ecuci el Mallie IIICY Mouis
The latest of th	C IIIII IIIII IIIII IIII IIII IIII III	Conor on Nome	ecuci el Mallie IIICY Mouis
The latest of th	C IIIII IIIII IIIII IIII IIII IIII III	Conor on Nome	ecuci el Mallie IIICY Mouis
The latest of th	Colliner Illiekeed Curre Work	Momo none	ecuci el Mallie IIICY Mouis

Std Standard Std Ref Referenc Ref Rate Amount Curren Rate e Amount Curren

Narrative

Matter Name

2/9/2016 1:12

COST CARD LISTING

Client: 055457 Jed Margolin

Cost Work Cost Curre Qua Rate Amou WIP WIP Bi Time	Matter Matter Name Narrative	Std Standard Std Ref Referenc Ref
Index Date Type ncy ntity nt Qty Rate Amou lie keep N	Number	Rate Amount Curre Rate e Curre

REDACTED

ATTA CLOCK WITH THIRD THE MATTER CANADAS ATTERNOOT IN TAIL ATTERNATION OF THE ATTERNATION OF THE PARTY OF THE	CONTRACTOR		Charles and the second		Standing with the con-		197
	el.		A.			Managana sanasa	
23669 11/13/ Service USD 39 2015 Fee	1.00 36.0 36.00 1.00	0 36.0 36.00 🗹 2086 0			vice Inc Service #70488: rk - First Judicial District	36.0 36.00 USD 0	36.00 USD 0
23754 12/31/ Research USD 05 2015	1.00 79.2 79.28 1.0 8	0 79.2 79.28 ☑ 2086 8		nd litigation WA ⁻ NV (Ran	omson Reuters - Account: TSON ROUNDS, RENO (1000549287) - Date nge: 12/01/15-12/31/15 - stlaw, WestlawNext	79.2 79.28 USD 8	79.2 79.28 USD 8